

Sales catalogues: Hurcomb

Publication/Creation

10th July 1931

Persistent URL

<https://wellcomecollection.org/works/hc427egz>

License and attribution

This work has been identified as being free of known restrictions under copyright law, including all related and neighbouring rights and is being made available under the Creative Commons, Public Domain Mark.

You can copy, modify, distribute and perform the work, even for commercial purposes, without asking permission.



Wellcome Collection
183 Euston Road
London NW1 2BE UK
T +44 (0)20 7611 8722
E library@wellcomecollection.org
<https://wellcomecollection.org>

Commins
Original

Hurcombs 10th July 1931

21.11.31

WAIHMM/CMISa111/77

HUR.	DATE	INITIALS
14.10.31 SALE	10 VII. 31	COMINS
PURCHASE		
CHECKED	13. VII. 31	KL
COLLECTED	16. 7. 31	gfb
RECEIVED	16. 7. 1931.	S. Bg.
ACCESSED		
PASSED		



ANT

Hurcombs, Grafton Galleries, W. 1.

On Friday, 10th July, 1931, at 12 o'clock

to be followed by Sale of China, Cut Glass, Ivories, Bronzes,
Bracket and Mantel Clocks, Needlework, Embroideries, &c.
at 12.30 p.m.

On View Day Prior

Km 243 £14.10.0

Phone:- Gerrard 5971-4



Original

**ANTIQUE and MODERN
BOOKS**

to sold at

Hurcombs, Grafton Galleries, W. 1.

On Friday, 10th July, 1931, at 12 o'clock

to be followed by Sale of China, Cut Glass, Ivories, Bronzes,
Bracket and Mantel Clocks, Needlework, Embroideries, &c.
at 12.30 p.m.

On View Day Prior

Mon 24 3 14.10 Phone:- Gerrard 5971-4

CONDITIONS OF SALE.

1. The highest bidder shall be the Purchaser, and if any dispute arise between two or more bidders the lot shall be put up again and re-sold, the Auctioneer being the sole Arbitrator in such disputes.
2. No person to advance less than one shilling; above five pounds, five shillings, and so on, in proportion, or less, at the discretion of the Auctioneer.
3. The Auctioneer to have the right to refuse a bidding at his discretion, and to bid on behalf of the Vendor in the case of lots upon which there is a reserve.
4. The Purchaser to give his name and address, and to pay a deposit of five shillings in the pound, or more, or the whole of the purchase-money, if required.
5. The lots to be taken away and paid for, with all faults, imperfections and errors of description, at the Purchaser's risk and expense the day after the sale, W. E. HURCOMB not being responsible for the correct description, genuineness, or authenticity of, or any fault or defect in, any lot, and making no warranty whatever; and in default W. E. HURCOMB is not to be held responsible if the lots, or any of them, are lost, damaged, or destroyed, and whether the purchase-money, or any part thereof, has been paid or not. In cases where a buyer purchases more than one lot the whole must be paid for before any one lot is delivered.
6. Any Purchaser neglecting to pay for and take away any lot or lots purchased within one day after the sale (not having been re-sold in accordance with the seventh condition) shall pay, in addition to the purchase-money, the sum of one shilling per week for warehouse-room, and also at the rate of five per cent. per annum interest on the purchase-money, to be reckoned from this day.
7. On failure of complying with the above Conditions, the money deposited shall be forfeited, and all lots remaining uncleared shall be re-sold by public or private sale, without notice, and the deficiency (if any) attending such re-sale, together with all incidental charges, shall be made good by the defaulter at this sale.
8. The Auctioneer will not recognise the transfer of any lot from one buyer to another. All lots at purchaser's risk on the fall of the hammer.

The only way in which goods can be cleared is by an Order issued from the Office. Any other clearance is not allowed or recognised.

Telephone: Gerrard 5971-4.

Lot	Amount	Date	Description
1	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
2	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
3	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
4	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
5	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
6	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
7	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
8	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
9	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
10	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
11	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
12	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
13	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
14	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
15	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
16	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
17	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
18	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
19	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
20	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
21	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
22	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
23	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
24	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
25	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
26	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
27	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
28	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
29	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
30	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
31	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
32	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
33	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
34	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
35	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
36	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
37	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
38	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
39	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
40	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
41	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
42	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
43	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
44	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
45	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
46	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
47	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
48	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
49	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
50	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
51	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
52	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
53	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
54	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
55	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
56	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
57	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
58	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
59	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
60	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
61	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
62	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
63	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
64	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
65	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
66	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
67	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
68	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
69	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
70	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
71	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
72	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
73	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
74	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
75	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
76	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
77	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
78	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
79	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
80	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
81	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
82	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
83	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
84	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
85	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
86	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
87	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
88	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
89	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
90	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
91	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
92	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
93	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
94	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
95	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
96	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
97	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
98	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
99	100.00	1/1/19	100.00
100	100.00	1/1/19	100.00

BUYER Comins

Date 10. 7. 31

AUCTIONEERS Hurcombs

Lot	Amount			Lot	Amount		
	£	s.	d.		£	s.	d.
5	1	-	-				
7	2	10	-				
11	2	15	-				
17	3	5	-				
19		10	-				
20		10	-				
49	1	-	-				
52	2	-	-				
55	1	-	-				
	£ 14	10	-				

CATALOGUE

On FRIDAY, 10th JULY, 1931

BOOKS

(Books sold not subject to collation)

- 1 Kate Greenaway, The Pied Piper of Hamelin, and Dickens' Works, Household Edtn., parts 48 - 79 10/-
- 7 2 Johnson, S., Dictionary of the English Language, 1755, (2) fol. 1st Edtn. 10/-
no name
- 3 Sir W. Raleigh, History of the World, 1614-7, (2) (faulty)
- 4 Children's Books, (43) and 17 others 3/15/-
- 20/- 60/- 5 Salmon's Botanologia, The English Herbal, (1) various (25) and a parcel of prints ✓/-
- 6 Smith, G., Cabinet Maker's Guide, 1826, and Manwaring's Designs for Chairs, (no title page) 8/15/-
- 2/10/- 60/- 7 Hodges, W., Select Views in India, 1786, plates, fol., 2 vols. in 1
- 8 Twentyone Swiss costume plates, 5 other prints and a scrap book 57/6 Ring
- 9 Boswell's Life of Johnson, 1792, vols. 1 & 2 only, cf. 10/-
- 10 Apperley, Life of John Mytton, 2nd Ed., 1837, coloured plates, hf. mor. 7/10/-
- 2/15/- 5/- 11 Sowerby's English Botany in manuscript, coloured plates, (2) and a parcel of prints 15/-

6. 12

Recuerdos de Lima Album, by Bonnafie, 2 vols.,
coloured lithographic plates £9 Spence

13

Stow, A., Survey of London, enlarged by J. Strype,
(2) fol. 1720 no Bid.

14

A 15th Century MS. on vellum with 7 fine illuminated
initials, dated 1481, in contemporary stamped leather
with brass bosses and clasps £7.

15

A 14th Century Ecclesiastical MS. of German origin,
bound in pigskin over boards with brass bosses £3.

16

Beckford, Thoughts upon Hunting, 1782, 2nd Edn.

3/5/- 50/- 17

Duquesne, A New Voyage to the East Indies, maps,
1696, Baltimore's Tour to the East, 1707, Patten's
History of the Rebellion, 1717, and 6 others marks £2

18

Representations of Dresses, Morals and Customs in
Holland, coloured plates 3/15/-

10/- 7. 19

The Athenian Sport, 1707, (1)

10/- 60/- 20

A folio, tooled cf. binding with metal bosses and
mounts

21

Dickens, Bleak House, 1853, David Copperfield, 1850,
Little Dorrit, 1857 and Dombey & Son, 1848, 4 vols.

22/6 marks

22

Dickens, Mystery of Edwin Drood, orig. 6 parts in
green wrappers, 1870, and 4 other books 2/10/-

22a

Lamartine, Oeuvres de Lamartine, 1832, 4 vols. with
inscription in vol. 1, tooled leather Passed

23

British Essayists, (45), and various (76) - 121

no Bid.

- 357 24 | Dickens, Battle of Life, 1st Edn., 2 others, Bewick's Birds, 1821, 2 vols., and Quadrupeds, 1824, Andrew's Medicine & Surgery, and a pamphlet *2/10/-*
machey-
- 25 A Breeches Bible, 1578 *10/-*
- 26 Cruikshank, Comic Almanacks for 1842, 1844-1847, 5 vols. plates, orig. wrappers *12/-*
- 28 Court of Common Pleas Rules, 1693, (faulty) and Kibburne's Survey of Kent, 1659 *20/-*
- 29 Orme, Historic Military and Naval Anecdotes, 1819, coloured plates, fol., crushed morocco, gilt *11/10/-*
- 30 C. L. Dodgson, An A.L.S., Christchurch, Oxford, June 6, 1890, to Miss Cooper, 2½pp. 12 mo. *35/-*
- 31 Catein, G., North American Indians, 1841-2, plates, 2 vols. *5/- Thorp.*
- 32 Dickens, Cricket on the Hearth, 2 copies, 1846, The Haunted Man, 1848, and another, and Caldecott's Pictures, 1 vol. - 5 *1/3d*
- 33 | Ranking, J., Historical Reseaches on War and Sports of Mongols and Romans, 1826, map extra illustrated, red mor. 4to *10/-*
- 34 Byron's Works, 1835-40, (17), Strickland's Lives of the Queens, 1844, (10), Scott's Waverley Novels (20), Charles O'Malley (2), and Byron's Works (4) *53*
1/3d
- 35 A parcel of coloured cartoons and etchings *5/-*
- 36 Dickens, David Copperfield, 1850 and 5 others, hf. bd., (faulty) *10/-*

- 37 The Bible, 1601 and Book of Psalms, Byron's Works, 7 vols., Punch 4 vols. and books various, 18 vols. *5/-*
- 38 Richardson, S., Clarissa, 1748-9, 2nd Edn., cf. (7), and Campbell's Lives of Lord Chancellors, 1846-7, cloth, - 7 *15/- my art.*
- 39 Dickens, C., David Copperfield, 1850, Bleak House, 1853, Dombey and Son, 1848, Lever's Dodd Family Abroad, 1854, The Daltons, 1852, Roland Cashel, 1850 and Smith's Christopher Tadpole, 1848, all hf. bd. *no Bid.*
- MR* 40 Higgin's Anaculypsis, vol. 1, 1878, N.Y., Ennenoser's Magic, 1854, (2), Lilly's Astrology, M.D., The Hemptameron, (5) and 2 others *5/- Thorp.*
- 41 Frohawk's British Birds, Nests and Eggs, illustrated, cloth - 6 *7/6*
- 42 Gibbon's Decline and Fall of the Roman Empire, vol. 1 3rd Edn. vol. II - VI. 1st Edn., 1777-81-88, (6) fol. bds., (faulty) *no Bid.*
- 43 Dickens, C., Works, Gadshell Edn., with Life, cloth - 38 *5/10/-*
- 44 The Dickensian Magazine, vols. 1 - 4 in 48 parts, 1905-8 *7/6*
- 45 Ars Quatuor Coronatorum, 10 parts *no Bid.*
- 46 Boswell's Johnson, Ed. Ingpen, illustrated parts - 13
- 47 Pratt, A., Flowering Plants, Ferns, etc., of Great Britain, Ed. E. Step, parts - 12 *20/-*
- 48 Belloc, H., The Old Road, 1904, Kipling's Jungle Book, 1908, O. W. Holmes (2) and L. Hunt, illustrated, cloth *5/-*

(20/-) 70/- (49) Voyage Pittoresque et Historique de L'Espagne, plates, fol. bds.

~~50~~ 50 Rapin's History of England, 1784, 2 vols. and index in 1, London Evening Post, 1 vol. and 1 other - 3 5/-

~~51~~ 51 Speed's Chronicle, (1), (faulty), Holmshed's Chronicles, (2 vols in 1), and Fabyan's Chronicle, (1), - 3 20/-

(12) 60/- (52) Carver, J., The New Universal Traveller, 1779, fol. maps and plates, Martin's History of Thetford, 1779, Collum's History of Hawsted, 1784, Lodger's History of Framling, 1798 and 1 other - 5

~~53~~ 53 Swammerdam, Book of Nature, plates, 1758, and Millar's Natural History, fol. (1), - 2

54 Keble, Statutes at Large, 1576, fol. (1), a Treatise of the Laws of the Sear, 1705, (1) and Berkeley's Naval History of Britain, 1756, plates &c. (1) - 3 20/-

(20/-) 4 (55) McAllester's Letters, (2 vols. in 1), 1757, Peck's Desiderata Curiosa, (2 vols. in 1), 1779, Grafton's Chronicle, 1568, (faulty), Froissart's Chronicles (2), and 1 other - 6

SALES OF JEWELS AND SILVER
EVERY FRIDAY

. . . Fortnightly Sales of . . .
Antique Furniture, China, Books,
Armour, Tapestries, Ivories,
Miniatures, Clocks, Persian and
other Carpets and Rugs.
Oil Paintings, Drawings, Prints
and Engravings.

Property can be included in any sale
at short notice

INVENTORIES & VALUATIONS FOR PROBATE,
DIVISION, INSURANCE AND OTHER PURPOSES

Sales of Furniture, etc., on
Owner's Premises a Speciality
Town or Country

Commissions. Executed. Moderate Terms

HURCOMBS, Grafton Galleries, W.1.

Telephone:
GERRARD 5971-4 (4 lines)